
CONDUIT FITTINGS cont’d 

The locknuts and bushing are straight 
connectors provide excellent pullout strength 
and can be installed without disassembly. The 
compression nut ratchet prevents unintentional 
loosening.

Bushings and Locknuts

	 PI331	 Plastic “Anti-Short” Bushings for 14/2, 14/3, 	 PK	 1		
		  12/2 BX cable, pack of 35	

PI331

CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION	 UOM	 ORDER MULTIPLE

Conduit Nipples*

	 PI301	 Conduit Nipple, pack of 2	   1/2”	 Offset	 PK	 1

	 PI303	 Conduit Nipple, pack of 2	   1/2” x 2”	 Straight	 PK	 1

PI301 is zinc die cast steel. PI303 is galvanized 
steel. All come with plated steel locknuts and 
plastic insulating bushings.

We have steel, insulated copper finish, and 
plastic electrical staples available.

PI301

						      ORDER
CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION	 SIZE	 CONNECTION	 UOM	 MULTIPLE

Electrical Staples

	 PI330	 Plastic; for 2 conductor Romex and other NM cable	 3/8” x 1/2”	 PK	 1	
		  conductor; 12/2–14/2 range; UV protected, pack of 50	
	 PI332	 Plastic; for 3 conductor Romex and other NM cable	 3/8” x 3/4”	 PK	 1	
		  conductor; 12/3–14/3 range; UV protected, pack of 50

	 PI309	 Steel; non-insulated for Romex and NM cable;	 1” x 1/2”	 PK	 1	
		  14/2–10/3 range, pack of 154	

	 ED273	 Insulated coppered finish; size #5, pack of 50	 5/8” x 1/4”	 PK	 1

	 ED273CX	 Insulated coppered finish; size #5, pack of 100	 5/8” x 1/4”	 PK	 1

PI330

						      ORDER
CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION		  SIZE	 UOM	 MULTIPLE

Devco Crimpers

	 5002	 Devco Crimpers; plastic coated handle	 EA	 1

CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION			   UOM	 ORDER MULTIPLE

Crimps insulated and non insulated terminals 
22 to 10 AWG, cuts bolts #4 40 through #10 
24, and strips stranded wire 22 to 10 AWG and 
solid wire 18 to 8 AWG. Features two precision  
ground wire cutters, one on the nose and the 
other behind the pivot point. Plastic cushion 
handle.

Heavy duty hand rivet tool that offers long 
handles to increase leverage and to secure 
the rivet in the nosepiece while the tool is in 
use. Powerful riveting capacity with 4 standard 
nosepieces to set 3/32, 1/8, 5/32, and 3/16” 
blind rivets.

5002

GENERAL TOOLS

Blind Rivet Tools

  	5107	 Heavy-duty tool; 4 interchangeable nose pieces to	 EA	 1	
		  accommodate 3/32”, 1/8”, 5/32”, 3/16” steel or 
		  aluminum rivets	

5107

CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION		  UOM	 ORDER MULTIPLE

Magnetic Hex Chucks

	 DE13	 Magnetic Hex Chuck	 1/4”	 7/16”	 1-3/4”	 EA	 1

	 DE14	 Magnetic Hex Chuck	 5/16”	 1/2”	 1-3/4”	 EA	 1

	 DE15	 Magnetic Hex Chuck	 3/8”	 9/16”	 1-7/8”	 EA	 1

	 DE23	 Magnetic Hex Chuck	 1/4”	 7/16”	 2-9/16”	 EA	 1

	 DE24	 Magnetic Hex Chuck	 5/16”	 1/2”	 2-9/16”	 EA	 1

	 DE33**	 Magnetic Hex Chuck	 1/4”	 7/16”	 3”	 EA	 1
**Magnetic insert bit holder with a “C” ring retainer

Magnetic Hex Chucks may be used with an 
electric drill to drive hex washer head screws.

DE15

					        HEX HEAD					     ORDER
CATALOG NO.	 DESCRIPTION		  SIZE			  DIAMETER		  LENGTH	 UOM	 MULTIPLE
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	Simplify Your Work.™74
NOTE: Item numbers in RED indicate Made in the U.S.A.

*Items in this section are Underwriter’s Laboratories listed or recognized under the prime manufacturer’s name.




